
 

 

 
Ahnentafel of 

Julius Mosby “Pooley” Alford, AAFA #0013 
 
 
 
 

 
1. Julius Mosby Alford b. Nov 20 1925, Pike Co., MS, occupation Owner of Alford Realty, d. Dec 23 

1995, McComb, Pike Co., MS, buried: Hollywood Cemetery, McComb, Pike Co., MS.  He was a 
founding member of the Alford American Family Association, #013.  He was one of the three original 
directors and the first treasurer.  He was one of only three who, in October 1995, had attended every 
one of the annual Corporate meetings and national Alford family reunions which are held each 
October.  Julius, known as "Pooley" was not married and will be missed. 

 
Parents 

 
2. Jacob Elias Alford b. Jan 28 1880, Rockport,Copiah County, Mississippi, m. (1) Jun  7 1905, in Pike 

Co., MS, Ella Rebecca Quin, b. Jan 24 1883, Pike Co., MS, d. Jun  5 1906, McComb, Pike Co., MS, 
buried: Hollywood Cemetery, McComb, Pike Co., MS, m. (2) Dec 20 1910, in New Orleans, Orleans 
Parish, LA, 3. Josephine Bertha Egloff, b. May  2 1889, New Orleans, Orleans Parish, LA, d. Sep  2 
1979, Pike Co., MS, buried: Hollywood Cemetery, McComb, Pike Co., MS.  She died of a stroke.  
Jacob died Feb 22 1972, Pike Co., MS, buried: Hollywood Cemetery, McComb, Pike Co., MS.  He 
died of a stroke.  He was enumerated in censuses - Copiah Co. MS 1880 0, 1900 21; Pike Co. MS 
1910 30, 1920 39. 

 
Grand Parents 

 
4. James Thomas Alford b. Apr 25 1840, Gallman, Copiah County, Mississippi, occupation Medical 

Doctor, m. (1) Jun 23 1864, in Copiah Co., MS, Martha Eliza Traweek, b. Jan 20 1843, Georgetown, 
Copiah County, Mississippi, d. Mar 30 1869, Copiah Co., MS, buried: Catchings Cem., Copiah 
County, MS, m. (2) Sep 29 1870, in Copiah Co., MS, 5. Julia Catchings Steele, b. Jan  6 1850, 
Copiah Co., MS, d. Apr 12 1916, Pike Co., MS, buried: Alford Cemetery, Copiah County, MS.  James 
died Jul 16 1894, Copiah Co., MS, buried: Alford Cemetery, Copiah County, MS.  He died of a stroke.  
In the Civil War he was a hospital steward.  He was enumerated in the censuses of Copiah Co, MS 
1850 10, 1860 21, 1870 30 and 1880 40.  He is mentioned in Harllee's KINFOLKS, page 1318  
CA20ac11. 

 
Great Grand Parents 

 
8. Julius Caesar Alford b. Dec 15 1808, Alfordsville, Robeson County, NC, m. Jan 22 1835, in Copiah 

Co., MS, 9. Mary Jane "Jency" Cammack, b. Jan 22 1815, Sumner County, Tennessee, d. Oct  7 
1896, Gallman, Copiah County, Mississippi, buried: Alford Cemetery, Copiah County, MS. Her 
parents immigrated from Ireland when her father was about fifteen years old.  Julius died Oct 15 1899, 
Gallman, Copiah County, Mississippi, buried: Alford Cemetery, Copiah County, MS.  He was 
enumerated in Copiah Co. MS in 1850 age 40, 1860 age 53 and 1870 age 68. 

 



 

 

Great Great Grand Parents 
 
16. James Alford b. 1764, Robeson Co., NC, m. about 1788, 17. Alice Katrain McTyer, b. about 1769, 

Robeson Co., NC, d. about 1837, Copiah Co., MS, buried: Ard Cemetery, Copiah Co., MS.  James 
died Feb 19 1839, Copiah Co., MS, buried: Ard Cemetery, Copiah Co., MS.  A copy of his will is on 
file with AAFA. 

3rd Great Grand Parents 
 
32. Jacob Alford b. Dec 12 1738, New Kent Co., VA, baptized: Feb 18 1738, New Kent Co., VA, m. 33. 

Mary Pace, b. Feb  1740, d. after 1810, Robeson Co., NC, buried: Fulmore Cemetery, Robeson Co., 
NC.  Jacob died about 1814, Robeson Co., NC.  His will was dated July 4, 1794.  Some family 
tradition says he is buried in the Fulmore, sometimes called Ashpole, cemetery in Robeson Co. NC 
but there are no stones or other evidence of his burial there. 

 
4th Great Grand Parents 

 
64. Lodwick Alford b. about 1710, New Kent Co., VA, m. (1) Elizabeth Cade, b. Apr 29 1717, New 

Kent Co., VA, d. May 29 1735, New Kent Co., VA, m. (2) 65. Susanna Cade, b. Sep 25 1718, m. (3) 
Unknown. There are some who think Susanna was a Hartley but there is no evidence to support the 
idea.  Others think she was a Cade with Lodwick turning to his late wife, Elizabeth Cade's, sister to 
help with the raising of young William Alford.  Lodwick died 1800, Franklin Co., NC.  There has 
long been a family tradition- reinforced by some DAR records- that Lodwick married a Rebecca 
Ferrell.  Nothing has been found to support this idea.  A North Carolina court record lists his wife as 
Sarah and some believe he married, Sarah the widow of his brother Goodrich.  It appears that the 
daughters of Goodrich were mentioned in Lodwick's will.  There is nothing to indicate the mother of 
any of the children other than William, Elizabeth and Jacob whose births are recorded in St. Peter's 
Parish, New Kent County, VA. 

 
5th Great Grand Parents 

 
128. James Alford b. about 1687, probably New Kent Co., VA,  died about 1730, New Kent Co., VA.  

Birth and death dates are estimates based on other recorded events in New Kent County, VA in the 
St. Peter's Parish Register. PLEASE NOTE:  It is not proven that he was the son of John Alford but 
there is some circumstantial evidence indicating that he is. 

 
6th Great Grand Parents 

 
256. John Alford b. about 1645, probably Virginia,  died Mar 14 1710, New Kent Co., VA.  


